
Royal Superior
B&B Construction                                             

of Chocwinity 
Lamar Homes

NO/YES NO/NO NO/YES

LOCATION Greensboro,NC Chocwinity, NC Sanford, NC

Property # DESCRIPTION Cost Cost Cost

 A 829 Russell Street 13,800.00$                                               9,000.00$                                            NO BID

 B 510 Cleveland Street 16,675.00$                                               12,000.00$                                          8,625.00$                         

 C 600 Henry Street 23,700.00$                                               NO BID NO BID

 D 1311 Clark Street 54,520.00$                                               39,950.00$                                          NO BID

 E 1413 Rosewood Ave 13,800.00$                                               5,800.00$                                            5,000.00$                         

 F 1420 Rosewood Ave 13,800.00$                                               5,800.00$                                            4,980.00$                         

 G 1025 Tarboro Street 21,680.00$                                               NO BID NO BID

H 724 Rose Street 27,110.00$                                               20,500.00$                                          8,800.00$                         

I 809 Belleview Avenue 22,200.00$                                               NO BID NO BID

J 106 E Logsboro Road 84,430.00$                                               NO BID NO BID

291,715.00$                                             93,050.00$                                          27,405.00$                       

-$                                                           48,950.00$                                          27,405.00$                       

BID TABULATION SHEET -  RFP 320-061222APG                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                              

BID OPENING DATE: 01/11/2023

Spring Hope, NC

227,390.00$                               

COMPANY NAME

HUB CERTIFIED/MWBE

Cost

NO/NO

AWE Homes

TOTAL

10,200.00$                                  

12,500.00$                                  

17,200.00$                                  

58,100.00$                                  

8,900.00$                                    

17,200.00$                                  

63,590.00$                                  

AWARD TOTAL 112,990.00$                               

9,700.00$                                    

15,000.00$                                  

15,000.00$                                  


