



	COMPANY NAME	Awe Home Repair	Compendium Contracting LLC	Pinam Construction Inc
	HUB CERTIFIED/MWBE	NO/NO	NO/NO	YES/YES
	LOCATION	Spring Hope, NC	Sanford, NC	Durham, NC
Property #	DESCRIPTION	Cost	Cost	Cost
Property A	819 Gay St	\$ 16,600.00	\$ 14,789.00	\$ 14,550.00
Property B	1104 Beechwood Dr	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 14,825.00	\$ 14,999.99
Property C	912 Cedarbrook Dr.	\$ 11,200.00	\$ 14,760.00	\$ 13,800.00
Property D	817 Evergreen Rd.	\$ 12,850.00	\$ 14,700.00	No Bid
Property E	717 Redgate Ave.	\$ 11,220.00	\$ 14,625.00	\$ 6,950.00
Property F	1909 Lynne Ave.	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 14,690.00	\$ 14,800.00
Property G	119 Dalewood Dr	No Bid	\$ 14,950.00	No Bid
Property H	1808 Beverly Rd.	\$ 14,500.00	\$ 14,850.00	\$ 14,600.00
Property I	505 Railroad St.	\$ 46,800.00	\$ 39,950.00	No Bid
SUBMITTED TOTALS		\$ 140,170.00	\$ 158,139.00	\$ 79,699.99
NEW TOTAL				
AWARD TOTAL		\$ 50,550.00	\$ 69,590.00	\$ 21,500.00